Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KI/TV(N)/634/2018-20

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2020

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2020 ©MaTQo6nid 29
Aello § 92150y 29th September 2020
o CIS; 1196 &av/] 13 m“,\’f? 2216
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 13th Kanni 1196
Tuesday 1942 @Ry wilmo 7
7th Aswina 1942
GHh 03 MAINID
oo (Pl dldmoem-adl) Aldsa]
Qlle6rmialmo
MmId 7733/ee105.m12/2020/0Clomo. @030, 2020 &AVaiPoc1@ 28
1196 waml 12

1942 @voilmo 6.

2020 ©Maiqoenid 26-00 MW@ 6H:08 NAIBRPA All8oeNINSLSIOTI @IeY
alO@}M 03I ®alomMWBMNEIRBINS @nolalleelssnol O®INO@D

(@IMl@LEQ|SICMYIM].

1AIBEINN®S 20O (@ IE:000,

@oallas enioenyy all. &&s.,
mlwa VS50l

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2020-9£1 60-20 MNIA 6323V

2020-9£1 6HO8 HalN}dls 6MIFo dOMISIENS] chHamIwl
(ceaum]) aadaulmamdm’

c@00® OloJeRlesllon ag)$lel@BIOIAMIo  MVLAICTLOCTHIT GHO8 WAUABGNA

aflgoenioee SO ©).

2008-6)£1 BHHOB 6210}B5lS BMIF0 OMO¥IRINE] UMW @DEY

6RAVDI 2IgRMBIMI8s
&0}

s3008Wlmnaday

aflole,.—2020-0e1 6508 6210}&ls 650 6®I¥IeNg] eeuamlul (6RRUGI)

®dSlmmmy  (2020-ee1  42) 2020 =oeel  29-0, @G HOB  VAIRENA
Qilgoenioes;omIloym @lmoelo;

2020 @MY 24-00 @IV G2UBM  GHOS TVoMLNIM  MIVATVEWOS
MLEMSNOMI@  (EINS®M® BBAWIMNMAVIAT) aldh0o MLoNIM MIWATVEIAS G0}
@B ©30NUM@IM88 &0} ild MlamEDI®  @PAI®Gle lesnmalmgo
aIOROBNM Mo BSl@IBlOM @IMOoel}o;

ROOMOMIHY BOEMALISM@NS 213-00 @OMB5JGo (2)-00 GUEMWo (ag)) Daleemb

@000 @I  &dWlmmailay 2020 &66NId  5-00 @I (@loenielio
LMDV 0}@aM@IMIL0;

E@m®  aedallmmadleel anQIoewd  Mleinl3emodIoleaimaldto
9QUHAEERUB DENBIGIOAM GIMILI0;

608 MoMNIM MIWANVE TVEMASMOBILIEOODIMOILIo @IM VMO MSals]
ag)S}CHOMD® G@RYQIUDIMIBIIM MaNal0IEBRUd Mlelaileneemzary 608 NQIRENAHS)
@6NI0RLIMOIDIBlBNM @IMIEI0;

DG 008, @P@IMI@, BIOOOTIONG BOEMLISM@ES 213-0o @OMYBaIG0 (1)-00
QUEMLEI®I00  M@DHOe]s G@OWlB:00630d  alldlewouils), 608  1WAIBENAE
92690 |0 SAWIMMY Qil80enIne)e |SIoYmIIMI—

1. 21)0)B9Be |00 (@1000EAI0.—(1) M aodallmadavlal 2020-6081 G308 6.210)lS
8930 6©®I%1e108] eauamilull (6eRVWMI) B30BAIMMMY ag)aY Gald alO@Do.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) @ 2020 =meeel 300, OO (@EMIEKO®I@  AUM®I
B0} M) |ESENB®IEN).

2.2008-0e1 17-00 @Y ®I@H60eildn0D] BEENMI 6).21QYEa|ESENEMIET).—EDD
a03ulmaday mlelailelldlesym &oe1o) 2008-01 8508 §)2103&]S 8MIS0 OISR
eaHnMIWl @Gy (2008-0e1 17) (DO@IMGUDaHo  (@IWIM  G@OE]  af)aNIET)

al000BUlE0eQ|Sid)  3-00  QABIGd  ABONILSDVIBENM  BRENGIBUBHE)
aillew@mo@] (@ 1oenielmienzoldlasnam@oem).

3. 5-00 Q1)q 1903 GREROMI.—(@IWIM BYBQIOE! 5-00 QAlds)a |@d,—

(i) (D00 2ol l@ “MGl DOI® Ot o)  QUIBEEGUBHE)  ald@o
“M3q] ad)eNBal@ 0al” ad)aN QAUIBN}BUD B2IBBHOENBMOE;

(i) (2)-00 Dol “MFl DOJI® O’ o) AUIBNGUBHE  aldOo
“M3g] ag)eNBal@® Oalt” ag)IM QAUILNEUD B2IBCHOENIIG;

(iii) (3)-00 DalQIdefl@d “oyMIQl MO@o @} ©}al” )N QUIBENEUDHE)
ald0o “0aMgl @POaI® 0al” ad)aN QAUIBNBUB B2IGBBOENB®OIE).

4. 0G080EI0 &9l0NeeeR—(1) 2020-081 GHO8 ©2I0}BlS IS HMIYIRINS]
eaHaMIWl (6cRVWD) sodlmMmMMS (2020-0e1 42) O@IMIE 038l DIolesymm;.

(2) ®REROM 03I8SIDIOMOIGOMEM @Yo, (EIMIT® BIBUIMABAY (@ 18000
BRI ©2IQY6]3 EIWIM BYBHIMVBBIFIMD V@ oBo®ESIE0 BI0BDO ag)S}Om
oBOOBIERe MSalsSle@d D &BAWIMMMY (@100 GRRNMI 621Q6e)a]3 (IWIM
@SB IS 6.21VDO@ICWI af)S}OH@ICWI B0} |ESENBEIENT).

@0lal Ma0MAE 61000,
DQICPE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No0.7733/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 28th September, 2020

12th Kanni, 1196
6th Aswina, 1942.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 (60 of 2020).

By order of the Governor,

ARAVINTHA BABU P. K.,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2020-0£1 6508 ©.210}&5ls 63250 O8] ceunmIwl
(eeeL®]) 6303aImadaS” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 60 OF 2020

THE KERALA SMALL PLANTATION WORKERS” WELFARE FUND
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India.
AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 2008.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers' Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (42 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on
the 29th day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session which convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India, the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 5th day of October, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala Small

Plantation Workers' Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 30th day of July, 2020.

2. Act 17 of 2008 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers' Welfare Fund Act, 2008 (17 of 2008)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments

specified in section 3 .
3. Amendment of section 5.—In the principal Act, in section 5,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words

“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words

“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(iii)) 1in sub-section (3), for the words “two hundred and forty rupees”, the words

“three hundred and sixty rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (28 of 2020) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the principal
Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the

principal Act as amended by this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202Q

[E]l  Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette. 4 Date:2020.09.29 08:40:11 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/



		2020-09-29T20:40:11+0530
	Salim A




